
 

Happy Father's Day Weekend!   

To all of our fathers: we appreciate you, and we wouldn’t be the 

amazing women we are today without you!  
 
I hope you have been taking to the skies and enjoying a beautiful 

June.  
  

Last weekend we had events in 2 states! 

 
Candie Oldham organized the table at the Chatham Airport Open 

House. We had ENE members represented across many different 

booths. Sherry Grobstein, Arlene Myers, Georgia Pappas, Beth 

Young, Katie Waters, Jen Lou Cooney and Kathlene Sage were all 

present and working the event. There was an estimated attendance 

of 6000 at the one-day event! Thank you, ladies, for representing 

our organization. 



 

Scarlet Brink and Sue Lin headed to Rutland, VT, and attended the 

newly formed Vermont Aviators Food Truck and Airport Event. This 

is a new series of events that will be happening at RUT and FSO 

throughout the summer. Mark your calendars for Sunday, August 

14 - we plan to have an ENE meet up at RUT.  Many thanks to  

Scarlet and Sue for representing us at this event. 





Let’s Support Our Teams in the AIR RACE 

CLASSIC!   

I am so proud that we have members on 2 teams in the competition 

this year. Three cheers for Merle and the wonderful artwork she has 

provided for support! Let’s cheer on Candie and the Missile 

Minions, Plane # 7, and Jamie Rousseau and the Magpies, Plane # 

42! Good luck, Missile Minions and Magpies!! 

 

The Sky is the Limit!!! 
 

Beth Young, ENE Chair 

 



 

Amelia Earhart Birthday 
Party 

Mark your calendars, it’s time 
for our annual Amelia Earhart 
Annual Birthday Party at 
Laconia.  Plan to join us at the 
airport on Saturday, July 16th 
from 1-3, for some 99’s 
camaraderie. Pack your own 
lunch; our hostess Karen 
Mitchell will provide birthday 
cake and drinks. We will not 
have a Chapter meeting in July, 
so come out for some fun with 
your sister 99s! 

 

Fall Section Meeting Dinner - 
Sponsor a New Member! 

 

 

Calling all Chapter members! 
 
We want your photos! This is a 
‘Call for Cameras’! We are 
planning to develop a series of 
notecards featuring our 
members aviation 
photographs.  We will be 
making a “Call for Art”  in the 
Fall/Winter season but we want 
you to have those cameras 
ready and use them now when 
you head to the airfield! 

 



It’s been a long few years. With 
the pandemic keeping us 
shuttered away from each other 
the past few years, it has been 
difficult to enjoy the 
camaraderie our organization is 
known for, and it has been 
extremely difficult to build a 
sense of community for new 
members in our organization. 
 
To encourage our new 
members to be involved. we 
would like to invite some of 
them to our Fall Section dinner 
as our guests. Are you willing 
to sponsor a new member to 
the Section dinner? The cost 
for the dinner/cruise will be 
$65. If you are willing to share 
the cost of sponsorship and 
provide 1/3 ($22) or 1/2 ($33) or 
the full cost ($65) to sponsor a 
new member, it would be 
appreciated. Please respond to 
Sue Benua 
at treasurer@womenpilotsene.or
g  by 7/16 (Our Amelia Earhart 
Picnic) if you can donate. 
Donations will be collected 
when you register for the 
Section meeting, but we would 
like to know how many new 
members we can offer a free 
dinner to before registration 
opens. We have 30 new 
members in the past 2 years! 

  

 

 

Every One of Us Is a Recruiter!  

 

I have seen so many of you in 
action talking to the public 
about taking an introductory 
flight or about joining our 
organization. Here are some 
tools to help target our 
potential new members.  
Attached is a 99’s poster and 
small card suitable for a wallet 
or to save on your phone with 
the QR code for the Ninety 
Nines website.  Potential new 
members can sign up here or 
get more information about our 
programs. Many thanks to 
Merle for creating the pocket 
card!  
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https://mcusercontent.com/ 
8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c/file
s 
/0eb5d230-710c-24a0-c820-
56d59c97bf16/ 
ENE99s_Recruit2022.pdf 
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